SHERIFF SALE LIST

TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 8, 2016 AT 1:30 P.M.

MAHONING COUNTY COMMISSIONERS' HEARING ROOM

CASE NO. LOCATION MINIMUM BID
1. 15CV0629 1640 MAHONING AVENUE YCL #18393 $33,442.41
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44509 PLUS COSTS
VS LEOPOLD LLC ET AL 53-067-0-067-000 NO BID
2.15CVv0993 152 N. CANFIELD NILES ROAD $37,632.17
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44515 PLUS COSTS

VS DAVID K RIGGS, ET AL

3. 15CV1666
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS WILLIAM A MCKINLEY ET AL

4. 15CV1862
SKW PREP LLC
VS DESONIA DRUMMOND ET AL

5. 15CV2742
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS PAULA J CHIZMAR ET AL

6. 15CVv2789
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS TODD B STULLER ET AL

7.16CV0164
SKW PREP LLC
VS JODI L ROGERS ET AL

8. 16CV0518
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS AMY M GIANCOLA ET AL

9. 16CV0829
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS BRIAN J URICHICH ET AL

10. 16CV0894
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS JAMES B EVA ET AL

11. 16CV1005
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS DOROTHY L MILLER ET AL

12. 16CV1008
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS WILLIAM M LYDEN ET AL

13. 16CV1017
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS DANNY MCGIRR ET AL

48-030-0-076-000

1025 W. RAYEN AVENUE, YCL # 1191
YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44502
53-072-0-149-000

537 E. AVONDALE AVENUE
YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44507
53-116-0-075-000

4600 FITZGERALD AVENUE, LOT 27
AUSTINTOWN, OH 44515
48-075-0-110-000

152 N. CANFIELD NILES ROAD
YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44515
48-030-0-076-000

244 NORWOOD AVENUE
YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44504
53-009-0-245-00

1657 BROWNLEE AVENUE, YCL NO 39908

YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44514
53-192-0-176-000

166 MANCHESTER YCL NO 34096 &
MANCHESTER, YCL NO 34097
YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44509
53-171-0-141-000 & 53-171-0-142-000

8483 IVY HILL LOT #50
YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44514
29-059-0-010-000

317 WESTMINISTER AVE LOT 755
YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44515
48-024-0-341-000

3839 ELMWOOD LOT 210
YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44515
48-009-0-279-000

248 S. MAIN ST. LOT 271 N &

LOT 272 S

AUSTINTOWN, OH 44515
48-012-0-128-000, 48-012-0-129-000

PREMIER REAL

ESTATE MGMT LTD
$16,303.70

PLUS COSTS

RAYEN PROPERTIES LLC

$19,821.94
PLUS COSTS
NO BID

$21,734.47
PLUS COSTS
NO BID

$14,826.45
PLUS COSTS
NO BID

$10,725.76
PLUS COSTS
NO BID

$12,631.46
PLUS COSTS
MOHAMMAD ASIF

$11,666.88
PLUS COSTS
NO BID

$9,680.00

PLUS COSTS

$16,100.00 PLUS COSTS
PREMIER REAL
ESTATE MGMT LTD

$11,026.32
PLUS COSTS
NO BID

$14,299.50
PLUS COSTS
NO BID

$18,242.72
PLUS COSTS
NO BID



SHERIFF SALE LIST

TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 8, 2016 AT 1:30 P.M.

MAHONING COUNTY COMMISSIONERS' HEARING ROOM

14.16CV1390
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS SANDRA O'NEIL, ET AL

15. 16CV1395
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS JAMIE SUE KONIOWSKY ET AL

16. 16CV1520
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY
VS CHRISTOPHER A NUTT ET AL

1933 MANHATTAN AVE YCL 21693
YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44509
53-173-0-007-000

2101 CONCORD AVE YCL 21555
YOUNGSTOWN, OH
53-178-0-013-000, 53-178-0-014-000

402 7TH STREET LOT 2705

7TH ST LOT 2704

STRUTHERS, OH 44471
38-018-0-015-000, 38-018-0-016-000

NEXT SHERIFF SALE: TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 22, 2016

NEXT AVAILABLE SHERIFF SALE LIST: TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 15, 2016

$7,726.78
PLUS COSTS
NO BID

$9,335.25
PLUS COSTS
NO BID

$6,229.22

PLUS COSTS
$11,000.00 PLUS COSTS
MOHAMMAD ASIF



