

**SHERIFF SALE LIST
TUESDAY, AUGUST 30, 2022 AT 1:30 P.M.
MAHONING COUNTY COMMISSIONERS' HEARING ROOM**

CASE NO.	LOCATION	APPRAISED	MINIMUM BID
1. 21CV1915 ALFA CORP VS MARK & SHIRLEY MCMILLEN	395 E. VERMONT AVE SEBRING, OH 44672 21-006-0-293.00-0	\$94,000.00	\$40,000.00 JOHN TUEL
2. 22CV0199 PREMIER BANK VS VERNON & SHIRLEY BLAZEK	400 CALLA RD POLAND, OH 44514 05-064-0-001.00-0	\$147,000.00	\$86,500.00 PLAINTIFF
3. 21CV1759 DANIEL R YEMMA VS PAMELA LIGHTNER DECD ET AL	W. WOOD ST, LOT 356 (VACANT LOT) LOWELLVILLE, OH 44436 40-006-0-087.00-0		\$14,447.90 PLUS COSTS NO BID
4. 21CV1813 DANIEL R YEMMA VS LAURALEE MILLICH DECD ET AL	431 SOUTHWARD DR. YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44515 48-095-0-197.00-0		\$10,760.36 PLUS COSTS \$60,500.00 FIELD ACRES PROPERTY GROUP LLC
5. 21CV2106 DANIEL R YEMMA VS KARL PLEHN ET AL	POINTVIEW AVE. LOT 26764 (VACANT LOT) YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44502 53-069-0-145.00-0		\$1,675.62 PLUS COSTS NO BID
6. 21CV2109 DANIEL R YEMMA VS Q THOMPSON SERVICES LLC ET AL	SHERIDAN RD LOT 26914 (VACANT LOT) YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44502 53-069-0-333.00-0		\$2,715.35 PLUS COSTS NO BID
7. 21CV2134 DANIEL R YEMMA VS JOHN MCCANN ET AL	SOUTH AVE LOT 38436 (VACANT LOT) SOUTH AVENUE LOT 38437 (VACANT LOT) & SOUTH AVENUE LOT 38438 (VACANT LOT) 53-115-0-064.00-0, 53-115-0-065.00-0, 53-115-0-066.00-0		\$17,193.66 PLUS COSTS NO BID
8. 22CV0042 DANIEL R YEMMA VS KARL PLEHN ET AL	W. DEWEY AVE LOT 24256 EAST PART (VACANT LOT) W. DEWEY AVE LOT 24257 WEST PART (VACANT LOT) YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44511 53-131-0-174.00-0 & 53-131-0-175.00-0		\$12,872.67 PLUS COSTS NO BID

NEXT AVAILABLE SHERIFF SALE LIST: TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 6, 2022
NEXT SHERIFF SALE: TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 13, 2022